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                     Three Year Assessment Cycle for Fall 2022- Spring 2025 

Program Name: TRiO 

Assessment Coordinator: Michael Stokes 

 2022-2023 2023-2024 2024-2025 
 

Fall 
 

SLO1. Persistence Rate: 75% all 
participants served by the SSS 
project will persist from one 
academic year to the beginning of 
the next academic year or 
graduate/receive a certificate 
and/or transfer from a 2-year to a 
4-year institution during the 
academic year. 
 
SLO2. Good Academic Standing 
Rate: 90% of all enrolled 
participants served by the SSS 
project will meet the performance 
level required to stay in good 
academic standing at the grantee 
institution. 
 
SLO3. Graduation and Transfer 
Rates: 35% of 2017-18 new 
participants served will graduate 
with an associate’s degree or 
certificate within four (4) years. 
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4-year institution during the 
academic year. 
 
SLO2. Good Academic Standing 
Rate: 90% of all enrolled 
participants served by the SSS 
project will meet the performance 
level required to stay in good 
academic standing at the grantee 
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SLO4. Graduation and Transfer 
Rates: 30% of 2019-20 new 
participants served will transfer 
from a 2-year to a 4-year 
institution with an associate’s 
degree or certificate within four 
(4) years. 
 
 
SLO5. Tutoring: 65% of students 
who engage in tutoring will 
demonstrate an increase in their 
course content skills. 
 

SLO6. Tutoring: 65% of students 
who engage in tutoring will 
demonstrate an increase in their 
confidence that they can pass 
their course, test or assignment. 

 
SLO7. Civic Minded: A minimum 
of 60% of TRiO students who 
participate in the TRiO Civic 
Minded Series will gain knowledge 
and develop skills to become 
more informed, thoughtful, and 
productive individuals and 
citizens. 

 
SLO4. Graduation and Transfer 
Rates: 30% of 2020-21 new 
participants served will transfer 
from a 2-year to a 4-year 
institution with an associate’s 
degree or certificate within four 
(4) years. 
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who engage in tutoring will 
demonstrate an increase in their 
course content skills. 
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participate in the TRiO Civic 
Minded Series will gain knowledge 
and develop skills to become 
more informed, thoughtful, and 
productive individuals and 
citizens. 

 
SLO4. Graduation and Transfer 
Rates: 30% of 2021-22 new 
participants served will transfer 
from a 2-year to a 4-year 
institution with an associate’s 
degree or certificate within four 
(4) years. 
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who engage in tutoring will 
demonstrate an increase in their 
course content skills. 
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SLO8. Modality and Growth: 60% 
of students who participate in 
TRiO in all modalities will obtain 
the knowledge and skills. 

 

SLO8. Modality and Growth: TRiO 
will provide flexible services (in-
person, hybrid, remote, reflective 
etc.) to enable 60% of students 
who participate will obtain 
knowledge and skills. 

 

 

SLO8. Modality and Growth: TRiO 
will provide flexible services (in-
person, hybrid, remote, reflective 
etc.) to enable 60% of students 
who participate will obtain 
knowledge and skills. 

 
 

Spring 
 

Continued assessment of SLO# 1-
8. 
 
 
 

Continued assessment of SLO# 1-
8. 

 
 
 

 

Continued assessment of SLO# 1-
8. 
 

 
Featured ISLO 

 

 
Effective Communication 

 
Information Literacy 

 
Citizenship 

 
Which of that 
year’s PSLO(s) 
will be used to 

assess the 
featured ISLO? 

 

   
SLO 7 
 

*Critical Thinking and Lifelong Wellness will be assessed in 2025-2026 and 2026-2027 respectively 

https://skylinecollege.edu/sloac/isloassessments.php

